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Background and aims:

The COVID-19 pandemic has disrupted the provision of diabetes 
care in the UK with many routine clinic visits replaced with video 
or telephone appointments. Using an online survey we aimed to 
investigate the effect that the pandemic had on diabetes self-
management as well as the increased provision of telehealth.

Methods:

An anonymous questionnaire was distributed in collaboration with 
Diabetes UK local groups in the Scottish Highlands and in Northern 
Ireland via their email lists. 

We conducted a thematic analysis of responses combined with 
descriptive analysis.

Results:

For many of the respondents’ diet and daily exercise deteriorated 
during the pandemic due to greater food intake and less outdoor 
activity. Conversely for some individuals’ diet improved, and 
exercise increased, due to more time and freedom associated 
with working from home. We also found that despite greater 
convenience, participants thought telehealth was often a poor 
substitute for face-to-face appointments. Routine screening and 
health monitoring was delayed or cancelled by health practitioners 
and contact with healthcare professionals was also delayed by 
respondents. 

Conclusions:

Greater access to telehealth services does not appear to 
compensate for negative effect on complication prevention and 
self-management associated with Covid-19. Going forward, less 
reliance on telehealth and a more blended targeted approach is 
required to ensure delay and escalation of diabetes complications 
does not have significant adverse effects on individual health and 
healthcare services, effects which decrease quality of life.
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